



**MINISTRY OF DEFENSE
AERONAUTICAL COMMAND
BRAZILIAN AERONAUTICAL COMMISSION IN WASHINGTON, D.C.**

**COMPARATIVE MAP
(IFB No.213937/CABW/2021)
AVIATION FUEL**

COMPARATIVE MAP

IFB REFERENCE No.	DELIVERY LOCATION	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AEG FUELS	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AV FUEL	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) WORLD FUEL
1	SCCI	0.832300	0.965261	0.9083
2	MTTP	1.396958	1.389549	1.3992
3	SCEL	0.734547	0.830295	0.8355
4	SVMJ	SEE NOTE	NO BID	NO BID
5	TTPP	0.688195	0.690165	0.6867
6	SPJC	0.688278	0.852644	0.6810
7	MPTO	0.661751	0.65713	0.6601
8	SABE	0.750487	1.890289	0.7566
9	MMUN	0.796401	0.921963	0.8311
10	SGAS	0.782342	NO BID	0.8261
11	SUMU	0.732774	NO BID	0.7299
12	SAWH	0.924949	NO BID	0.9300
13	SKBO	0.722672	0.8307	0.7593
14	MMMX	0.808372	0.921963	0.8475
15	MROC	0.977503	1.038199	1.0078
16	MPPA	0.679987	NO BID	0.7472
17	SEQM	0.713278	1.024542	0.7867
18	MGGT	0.750270	0.676943	0.7653
19	SKRG	0.699185	0.768928	0.7388
20	MMPR	0.835405	1.416495	0.8712
21	MMTG	0.840205	0.935172	0.8672
22	SPJM	0.688278	NO BID	0.6810
23	SAME	1.107093	NO BID	1.1140

MIN. DEFESA
Proc: 213937
Rub: AF
CABW
C. AERONAUTICA

IFB REFERENCE No.	DELIVERY LOCATION	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AEG FUELS	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AV FUEL	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) WORLD FUEL
24	SLVR	0.961608	0.967665	0.9773
25	SYCJ	0.770986	1.091457	0.7761
26	SKCG	0.680790	0.777276	0.7179
27	SGES	0.965552	NO BID	0.9732
28	SAAV	1.058763	NO BID	1.0815
29	SAZM	1.085814	NO BID	1.0868
30	SCIE	0.813664	0.897342	0.8797
31	SAVT	1.112168	NO BID	1.1114
32	SACO	0.779445	0.77997	0.7781
33	MSLP	0.795196	0.809003	0.7960
34	SAAP	1.098959	NO BID	1.0929
35	SLCB	0.967720	0.97559	0.9945
36	SOCA	1.030826	1.028137	1.0412
37	SMJP	0.848117	NO BID	0.8376
38	MHTG	0.766255	NO BID	0.7742
39	SKVV	0.720007	NO BID	0.8296
40	SKAP	0.720007	NO BID	1.3265
41	SAZB	1.107000	NO BID	1.1077
42	SAZS	1.125640	NO BID	1.1201
43	SAVC	1.124074	NO BID	1.1201
44	SULS	0.758552	NO BID	0.7703
45	SLLP	0.977733	0.970307	0.9913
46	KADW	0.689643	0.5178	0.6457
47	KHST	0.685947	0.523062	0.6434
48	KJFK	0.653236	0.668315	0.6945
49	KMCF	0.681616	0.5178	0.6434
50	KFLL	0.662148	0.690389	0.6944
51	KSBD	0.919332	NO BID	0.9832
52	KBFI	1.058173	0.9820	1.0949
53	KSFO	0.751960	0.743034	0.7941

M. DEFESA
 C. AERONAUTICA
 FI: 636
 Proc: 213937
 Rub: AF
 CAEW

IFB REFERENCE No.	DELIVERY LOCATION	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AEG FUELS	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AV FUEL	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) WORLD FUEL
54	KMIA	0.660563	0.655638	0.6543
55	KJAX	0.779430	0.753527	0.6381
56	MDSD	0.858163	0.860147	0.8670
57	KISP	0.820109	1.14237	0.7462
58	KPBI	0.688961	0.747688	0.6870
59	KDFW	0.678941	0.665224	0.7154
60	PANC	0.680903	0.679717	0.7647
61	KLSV	0.648675	0.5178	0.6372
62	KRIV	0.840094	0.5310	0.6916
63	TBPB	1.007673	0.691393	0.7494
64	TJSJ	0.702093	0.68183	0.7014
65	KAEX	1.180546	1.081452	1.2179
66	CYOW	0.895649	1.0684	0.9830
67	TNCC	0.735059	0.792836	0.7359
68	KSKF	0.898767	0.863724	0.9021
69	KBOS	0.696149	0.688944	0.6950
70	GCLP	0.667769	0.661462	0.6632
71	LPPT	0.652637	1.407619	0.6702
72	LKPR	0.657064	1.372722	0.7958
73	LGAV	0.659216	1.427009	0.6843
74	TFFF	0.755744	0.716907	0.7647
75	EDDH	0.636787	1.704396	0.6474
76	LIRA	0.659654	1.288899	0.6648
77	EPWA	0.686342	NO BID	0.8417
78	FHAW	0.612893	NO BID	0.6218
79	LEVC	0.655171	0.671501	0.6603
80	EGVN	0.612893	0.646275	0.6271
81	LIRP	0.681696	0.689676	0.6918
82	ENGM	0.697639	1.1179	0.7155
83	LPAR	1.104372	NO BID	NO BID

A. DEFESA
 F: 637
 Proc: 213937
 Rub: AF
 CABW
 C. AERONAUTICA

IFB REFERENCE No.	DELIVERY LOCATION	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AEG FUELS	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AV FUEL	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) WORLD FUEL
84	EFHK	0.753023	0.681698	0.8088
85	LSZH	0.671358	1.632879	0.7132
86	LIML	0.657934	0.673348	0.6604
87	LFPB	0.658002	1.376129	0.7169
88	ESSA	0.702809	0.694246	0.6968
89	LPPR	0.646416	1.411581	0.6795
90	LEMD	0.647275	0.648518	0.6515
91	EGLF	1.164484	1.167988	1.2047
92	LPPG	0.657282	1.362551	0.6631
93	EBMB	0.649346	NO BID	NO BID
94	LEBL	0.631430	0.640857	0.6366
95	LICJ	0.671135	1.345274	0.6725
96	LEZL	0.671053	0.670973	0.6744
97	EBBR	0.652508	0.653801	0.7645
98	GCTS	0.675462	0.660591	0.6766
99	LPBJ	0.673747	1.4096	NO BID
100	LSGG	0.681255	1.682438	0.7461
101	LIPE	0.679033	0.682438	0.6813
102	EGSS	0.684327	0.679162	0.7027
103	EDDK	0.636946	0.663814	0.6447
104	LGIR	0.708111	1.477413	0.7329
105	EDSB	1.572200	2.797168	1.6093
106	ESSL	1.484761	NO BID	1.5011
107	GVSV	1.152375	NO BID	1.3391
108	EDDB	0.697705	1.514096	0.7030
109	LIRQ	0.681567	1.363238	0.7026
110	GVAC	0.666905	0.68677	0.6739
111	GVNP	0.710776	0.729038	0.7083
112	FNLU	0.819158	NO BID	0.8266
113	HKJK	0.643274	0.656919	0.6549

M. DEFESA
 R. 638
 C. AERONAUTICA
 CABW
 213937
 AF

IFB REFERENCE No.	DELIVERY LOCATION	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AEG FUELS	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AV FUEL	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) WORLD FUEL
114	DTTA	0.680629	0.683362	0.6764
115	HECA	0.639348	0.661225	0.6485
116	DIAP	0.707210	0.714773	0.7466
117	LLBG	0.683950	0.730644	0.7029
118	OERK	0.636642	NO BID	0.6660
119	LLOV	0.927258	NO BID	NO BID
120	OMAA	0.636812	0.667565	0.6462
121	LTAI	0.644712	0.66729	0.6527
122	OLBA	0.737174	NO BID	0.7435
123	OMDB	0.620953	0.626618	0.6290
124	FAOR	0.688430	0.675966	0.6932
125	FQMA	0.800753	0.80512	0.8173
126	LTAC	0.663350	0.913156	0.6756
127	DGAA	0.731322	0.985787	0.7169
128	FQBR	0.816350	0.802108	0.8305
129	FAWK	0.845354	NO BID	0.8429
130	LTBA	0.652519	0.858102	0.6667
131	OJAM	0.769948	0.77931	0.7901
132	UBBB	0.739973	NO BID	0.7801
133	GMMX	0.712076	0.745469	0.7006
134	FPST	0.795555	NO BID	0.8237
135	FALE	0.684338	0.670347	0.6973
136	FKYS	0.909019	0.795028	0.9145
137	DNAA	0.714625	0.846066	0.7514
138	DAAG	0.705591	0.691948	0.7060
139	OTHH	0.634235	0.625033	0.6390
140	GMME	0.743993	0.747688	0.7478
141	UACC	0.814065	NO BID	0.9343
142	ZSSS	0.689750	0.697364	0.6983
143	ZBAA	0.684471	0.690759	0.6906

M. DEFESA
 C. AERONAUTICA
 Fl: 639
 Prt: 213937
 Rub: AF
 CABW

IFB REFERENCE No.	DELIVERY LOCATION	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AEG FUELS	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) AV FUEL	FINAL PRICE (US\$/L) WORLD FUEL
144	ZWWW	0.742482	0.753104	0.7602
145	ZSAM	0.697555	0.699741	0.7076
146	RJTT	0.660563	0.648333	0.6978
147	UUWW	0.985519	NO BID	0.9923
148	VOGO	0.644712	NO BID	0.6546
149	RJBB	0.721230	0.780129	0.7494
150	ZBYN	0.760037	0.758916	0.7803
151	UWUU	0.805863	NO BID	0.8366
152	VRMG	0.866508	NO BID	0.8784
153	VIAG	0.887766	NO BID	NO BID
154	VVNB	0.688321	0.686532	0.6901
155	VIDP	0.626299	NO BID	0.6287
156	ZSHC	0.697648	0.699213	0.7082
157	UHPP	0.816083	NO BID	0.8348
158	ZHHH	0.712961	0.713742	0.7148
159	ZGSZ	0.694976	0.696043	0.6967
160	UAAA	0.781170	NO BID	0.7833
161	VECC	0.635770	NO BID	0.6419
162	VABB	0.633604	NO BID	0.6354
163	RKSI	0.636721	0.643208	0.6426
164	WSSS	0.604035	-	0.6158

* Lowest final prices provided are highlighted in yellow.